
REGULAR SESSION

March 8, 2023

1. t/a Clout Southern Cuisine & Lounge, Edward Reynolds, Member, Class B(BLX), Beer, 
Wine and Liquor for the use of Clout Southern Cuisine & Lounge, LLC, 731 Cady Drive, 
Fort Washington, 20744. Clarification on the purchased agreement and information in the 
affidavit that was submitted with the application. Represented by John Walker- Turner, 
Esquire.

2. t/a Party Time Liquors – Sandeep Singh Deol, President, Harwinder Singh, Vice President, 
Jatinder Pal Singh, Secretary/Treasurer for a Class A, Beer, Wine and Liquor for the use of 
Party Time Liquors, Inc., t/a Party Time Liquors, 3307 Rhode Island Avenue, Mt. Rainier, 
20712. – Request for a Delivery Permit. Represented by Linda Carter, Esquire. 

3. Michele Tekam, Member, t/a Famous Lounge, 5010 Brown Station Rd. Unit# 150 Upper 
Marlboro, MD 20772, Class B, Beer, Wine, and Liquor, is summonsed to show cause for an 
alleged violation of RR No.#7 Consumption of Bottled goods on licensed premises (Bottle 
Service) and RR# 37 Alteration and Addition of the Rules and Regulations for Prince 
George's County, Maryland. To wit: On Saturday November 12, 2022, at approximately 
10:15 pm, two undercover Prince George's County Liquor Inspectors entered the Famous 
Lounge, located at 5010 Brown Station Rd. Unit #150, Upper Marlboro MD 20772. Once 
inside, they observed bottles of Patron in clear carafes being delivered to a table with 
sparkling lights, also igloos, which are structures used to seat patrons, were placed on the 
outside of the establishment, and being utilized without the Board's approval. The licensee is 
subject to all potential penalties identified in the Alcoholic Beverage Article, Rule 26 of the 
Rules and Regulations for Prince George's County and any other provision(s) governing said 
license, which may include other violation(s) identified at the hearing. Represented by Robert
Kim, Esquire. Continued from the February 8, 2023 and February 28, 2023 Regular Session 
Hearing.

4. Jemima B. Ablorh, Member, t/a Aroma Ultra Restaurant Lounge, 4000 Town Center Blvd
Lounge LLC Bowie, Maryland 20716. Class B, Beer, Wine and Liquor, is summonsed to 
show cause for an alleged violation of 26-1903 A licensed holder may not provide 
entertainment unless authorized to do so, of the Alcoholic Beverage Article of the Annotated 
Code of Maryland and R.R. No 37 (E) Change in mode of operation (Having entertainment 
without a permit), of the Rules and Regulations for Prince George's County. To wit; that on 
Thursday, November 10, 2022, at approximately 9:30 p.m., Inspector North entered Aroma 
Ultra Lounge at 4000 Town Center Blvd, Bowie, MD 20716 for an entertainment inspection 
and noticed a DJ playing music with DJ equipment. At that time, the establishment did not 
possess an entertainment permit. The licensee is subject to all potential penalties identified in
the Alcoholic Beverage Article, Rule 26 of the Rules and Regulations for Prince George's 
County and any other provision(s) governing said license, which may include other 
violation(s) identified at the hearing.



5. Laxmi Narenda Babu Vinnakota, Member/Authorized Person, t/a LAX Wine & Spirits, 
11011 Baltimore Avenue Beltsville, 20705. Class B+, Beer, Wine and Liquor, is summonsed
to show cause for an alleged violation of Maryland Annotated Code 2-315. Interaction 
between wholesaling entities and retailers, to wit; On Monday, December 20, 2021, at 
approximately 9:45am Agent Vince Allen of the Maryland Alcohol and Tobacco 
Commission witnessed Murray Kyle Francis from Republic National Distributing Company 
rotating wine bottles inside of the cooler in a licensed establishment. A wholesaler may not 
provide things of value, make a gift, or offer a gratuity to a retail dealer. Represented by 
Linda Carter, Esquire.

A virtual hearing will be held via Zoom at 7:00 p.m. on Wednesday, March 8, 2023. 
If you would like to attend, the link to the virtual hearing will be available one week prior 
on the BOLC’s website at http://bolc.mypgc.us or you may email BLC@co.pg.md.us to 
request the link. Additional information may be obtained by contacting the Board's Office 
at 301-583-9980.
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